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As the world's population swells and the need for sustainable ways of living grows ever more urgent and
obvious, prefabricated architecture has taken center stage. Even before our current predicaments, the mass-
produced, factory-made home had a distinguished history, having served as a vital precept in the
development of Modern architecture. Today, with the digital revolution reorganizing the relationship
between drafting board and factory, it continues to spur innovative manufacturing and design, and its
potential has clearly not yet come to fruition. Home Delivery traces the history of prefabrication in
architecture, from its early roots in colonial cottages though the work of such figures as Jean Prouvé and
Buckminster Fuller, and mass-produced variants such as the Lustron house, to a group of full-scale
contemporary houses commissioned specifically for the MoMA exhibition that this book accompanies. In
addition to an introductory essay by Barry Bergdoll, Chief Curator in the Museum's Department of
Architecture and Design, this volume contains essays on prefabricated housing in Japan and in Nordic
countries by Ken Tadashi Oshima and Rasmus Waern, respectively. It also includes focused texts on
approximately 40 historical projects and five commissions, as well as a bibliography.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Gans:

The book Home Delivery: Fabricating the Modern Dwelling can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a book Home Delivery: Fabricating
the Modern Dwelling? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can
give many information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge
or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Home
Delivery: Fabricating the Modern Dwelling has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Mohammad Darling:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific Home Delivery:
Fabricating the Modern Dwelling book as basic and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Levi Ryan:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Home Delivery: Fabricating the Modern Dwelling book is readable simply
by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer associated
with Home Delivery: Fabricating the Modern Dwelling content conveys prospect easily to understand by lots
of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different as it. So , do you
continue to thinking Home Delivery: Fabricating the Modern Dwelling is not loveable to be your top
checklist reading book?

Danna Bullock:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are related
is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in
the top collection in your reading list is Home Delivery: Fabricating the Modern Dwelling. This book that is
qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and
review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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